
  

DATE: JULY 21, 2021 
MEETING: BOARD OF CONTRACT & SUPPLY 
PRESENT: MAYOR DAVID, MR. FRANK, MR. SHAGER, MR. LAKE, MR. PADDOCK 
ABSENT:  NONE 

 
The meeting of the Board of Contract and Supply was called to order at 11:01 a.m. 
 

FIRST ORDER OF BUSINESS:  APPROVAL OF MINUTES: 
 

An approval of the minutes from the July 14, 2021 meeting was approved on a motion by Mr. Paddock and 
seconded by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored. 
 
SECOND ORDER OF BUSINESS: EMERGENCY DECLARARTION: 
 
An emergency declaration due to water seepage and suspected disturbed asbestos in the City Council 
Chambers and will allow the City to bypass the bidding process to make safe the structure if needed was 
approved on a motion Mr. Paddock and seconded by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored.  
 
THIRD ORDER OF BUSINESS: AWARD RECOMMENDATION: 
 
An emergency declaration due to water seepage and suspected disturbed asbestos in the City Council 
Chambers and will allow the City to bypass the bidding process. An award recommendation to FE Jones in the 
amount of $639,000.00 and Keystone in the amount of $20,000 for air monitoring was approved on a motion 
Mr. Paddock and seconded by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored.  
 
An award recommendation for the bid for 2021 Binghamton Fire Department (General) was awarded to the 
lowest bidder, Fahs Construction at a bid price of $5,884,000.00 on a motion by Mr. Shager and seconded by 
Mr. Paddock and unanimously favored. Funds are available in H3410.525326.72720 ($3,884,000.00) and 
H3410.525326 ($2,000,000.00) pending City Council Approval. 
 
An award recommendation for the bid for 2021 Binghamton Fire Department (Plumbing) was awarded to the 
lowest bidder, Petcosky Mechanical at a bid price of $590,000.00 on a motion by Mr. Paddock and seconded 
by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored. Funds are available in H3410.525326.72720. 
 
An award recommendation for the bid for 2021 Binghamton Fire Department (HVAC) was awarded to the 
lowest bidder, Piccirilli Mechanical, Inc. at a bid price of $974,000.00 on a motion by Mr. Shager and seconded 
by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored. Funds are available in H3410.525326.72720. 
 
An award recommendation for the bid for 2021 Binghamton Fire Department (Electrical) the bid bind bond 
was reject from apparent low bidder Huen on a motion for Mr. Frank and seconded by Mr. Shager and 
unanimously favored. The second lowest bidder, Upstate Company, at a bid price of $898,000.00 was 
approved on a motion by Mr. Shager and seconded by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored. Funds are available 
in H3410.525326.72720. 
 
 
 
 
 



  

THIRD ORDER OF BUSINESS:  CHANGE ORDER APPROVAL: 
 
Change order no. 1 in the amount of $210,365.00 with Albert Torto Construction for the 2021 Catchbasins, 
Manholes, Streets and Utilities Improvements was approved on a motion from Mr. Paddock and seconded by 
Mr. Lake and unanimously favored.  
 
              Contract History Original $:       $                 882,000.00 
               Change Order no 1:     $                  210,365.00   
  Contract Amount to date:         $               1,092,365.00 
 
FIFTH ORDER OF BUSINESS: PERMISSION TO ADVERTISE: 
 
Permission to advertise RFP for 2021 Hotchkiss Street Pump Station was approved on a motion by Mr. Shager 
and seconded by Mr. Paddock and unanimously favored. 
 
Permission to advertise RFP for 2021 LaGrange Street Pump Station was approved on a motion by Mr. 
Paddock and seconded by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored. 
 
Permission to advertise RFP for Repairs of Raw Water Traveling Screens was approved on a motion by Mr. 
Paddock and seconded by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored. 
 
SITH ORDER OF BUSINESS: ADD ON PERMISSION TO ADVERTISE: 
 
Permission to advertise RFP for Repair of Existing Irrigation System at Ely Park Municipal Golf Course was 
approved on a motion by Mr. Shager and seconded by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored. 
 
 
There being no further business for the Board, the meeting adjourned at 11:12 A.M. on a motion from Mr. 
Shager and seconded by Mr. Lake and unanimously favored.  
 
Respectfully Submitted,  
 
 
 
 
 
Billie J. Goodson 
Secretary Board of Contract & Supply 


